ORDINANCE NO. 2026-3
AN ORDINANCE AMENDING “THE CODE OF THE VILLAGE OF

SOUTH HOLLAND, ILLINOIS,” ADOPTED DECEMBER 7, 1987,
CHAPTER 6, ENTITLED “BUILDINGS AND BUILDING REGULATIONS”

WHEREAS, the Villag¢ of South Holland is Home Rule Municipality within the purview
of Article VI, Section 6(a) of the Illinois Constitution (1970), and the said Village, therefore, may
exercise any power and perform any function pertaining to its government and affairs.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of
the Village of South Holland, Cook County, Illinois, that Chapter 6, “Buildings and Building
Regulations”, Article I1., “Building Code”, is hereby amended as follows:

SECTION 1: That Division 1., Generally, Sec. 6-16, entitled “Adoption of building code”,
is hereby deleted in its entirety and the following is mserted in lieu thereof:

Sec. 6-16. Adoption of building codes.

A certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the village clerk of
the Village of South Holland being marked and designated as the International Building Code (2021)
be and 1s hereby adopted as the building code of the Village of South Holland in the State of Illinois.
The following codes as adopted herein shall include the following:

International Building Code: Appendixes E, F, G, H, [, J (2021);

International Residential Code: Appendixes E, ¥, G, H, J, K, M, O, T (2021);

International Mechanical Code: Appendix A {(2021);

International Fuel Gas Code: Appendixes A, B, C, D (2021);

International Wildland-Urban Interface Code (2021);

International Property Maintenance Code: Appendix A (2021);

[nternational Existing Building Code (2021);




International Private Sewage Disposal Code: Appendixes A, B (2021);
International Fire Code: Appendixes A, B, C,D,E,F, G, H, I, J, K, L, M, N (2021}

International Swimming Pool and Spa Code: Appendixes A, B, C,D,E,F,G, H. L J,K, L,
M, N (2021);

National Electric Code (2023);
International Energy Conservation Code (current edition as adopted by the State of Illinois)
lllinois State Plumbing Code (current edition as adopted by the State of Illinois)

Each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said codes are hereby
referred to, adopted and made a part hereof as if fully set out in this section.

SECTION2: That Division 1., Generally, Sec. 6-23, entitled “Reserved”, is hereby deleted
in its entirety and the following is inserted in lieu thereof:

Sec. 6-23. International Building Code Amendments.

There is hereby adopted by the Village the 2021 International Building Code, as hereinafter
amended.

Passim. Wherever the phrase “[name of jurisdiction]” or the word “jurisdiction™ appears, it shall
be deemed to refer to the Village of South Holland.

Passim. Wherever the phrase “code official” or “department of building inspection™ appears, it shall
be deemed to refer to the Village of South Holland.

SECTION 3: That Section 202 is amended to revise the following definition in its entirety
to read as;

Flammable Gas. A material that is gas at 680F (200C) or less at 14.7 pounds per square inch
atmosphere (psia) (101 kPa) of pressure [a material that has a boiling point of 680F (200C) or less
at 14.7 psia (101 kPa)] subdivided as follows:

1. Category 1A. A gas that meets either of the following:




1.1. Ignitable at 14.7 psia (101 kPA) when in a mixture of 13 percent or less by
volume with air.

1.2, A flammable range at 14.7 psia (101 kPa) with air of at least 12 percent,
regardless of the lower limit, unless data shows compliance with Category 1B.

2. Category 1B. A gas that meets the flammability criteria for Category 1A, is not
pyrophoric or chemically unstable, and meets one or more of the following:

2.1. A lower flammability limit of more than 6 percent by volume of air.
2.2. A fundamental burning velocity of less than 3.9 inches/second (99 mmy/s).

The limits specified shall be determined at 14.7 psi (101 kPa) of pressure and a temperature of 680F
{200C}) in accordance with ASTM E681.

Where not otherwise specified, the term “flammable gas” includes both Category 1A and 1B.
SECTION 4: That Table 307.1(1) is amended to include the following:
See Exhibit “A” attached hereto

SECTIONS: That Section3.07.4 is amended to revise the following definition inits entirety

to read as follows:

307.4 High-hazard Group H-2. Buildings and structures containing materials that pose a deflagration
hazard or a hazard from accelerated burning shall be classified s Group H-2. Such materials shall
include, but not be limited to, the following:

Class I, II or IlIA flammable or combustible liquids that are used or stored in normally open
containers or systems, or in closed containers or systems pressurized at more than 15 pounds per
square inch gauge (103.4 kPa).

Combustible dusts where manufactured, generated or used in such a manner that the concentration
and conditions create a fire or explosion hazard based on information prepared in accordance with
Section 414.1.3.

Cryogenic fluids, flammable.




Category 1A flammable gases.
Category 1B flammable gases having a burning velocity greater than 3.9 inches per second (10 cm/s).
Organic peroxides, Class I.

Oxiders, Class 3, that are used or stored in normally open containers or systems, or in closed
containers or systems pressurized a more than 15 pounds per square inch gauge (103 kPa).

Pyrophoric liquids, solids and gases, nondetonable.
Unstable (reactive) materials, Class 3, nondetonable.
Water-reactive materials, Class 3.

SECTION 6: That Section 3.07.5 isamended to revise the following definition in its entirety
to read as follows:

307.5 High-hazard Group H-3. Buildings and structures containing materials that readily support
combustion or that pose a physical hazard shall be classified as Group H-3. Such materials shall
include, but not be limited to, the following:

Class L, II or IIA flammable or combustible liquids that are used or stored in normally closed
containers or systems pressurized at 15 pounds per square inch gauge (103.4 kPa) or less.

Combustible fibers, other than densely packed baled cotton, where manufactured, generated or used
in such a manner that the concentration and conditions create fire or explosion hazard on information
prepared in accordance with Section 414.1.3.

Consumer fireworks, 1.4G (Class C, Common)

Cryogenic fluids, oxidizing

Category 18 flammable gases have a burning velocity of 3.9 inches per second (10 cm/s) or less

Flammable solids

Organic peroxides, Class Il and III




Oxiders, Class 2

Oxiders, Class 3, that are used or stored in normally closed containers or systems pressurized at 15
pounds per square inch gauge (103 kPA) or less

Oxidizing gases
Unstable (reactive) materials, Class 2
Water-reactive materials, Class 2

SECTION 7: That Section 414.2,5 is amended to revise the following definition in its
entirety to read as follows:

414.2.5 Hazardous material in Group M display and storage areas and in Group S storage
areas. Hazardous materials located in Group M and Group S occupancies shall be in accordance
with Section 414.2.5.1 through 414.2.5 4.

SECTION 8: That Section 414.2.5.4 is amended to revise the following definition in its
entirety to read as follows:

414.2.5.4 Flammable gas. The aggregate quantity of Category 18 flammable gas having a
burning velocity of 3.9 inches per second (10 cm/s) or less stored and displayed within a single
control area of a Group M occupancy or stored in a single control area of a Group S occupancy is
allowed to exceed the maximum allowable quantities per control area specified in Table 307.1(1)
without classifying the building or use as a Group H occupancy, provided that the materials are
stored and displayed in accordance with the International Fire Code and quantities do not exceed the
amounts specified in Table 414.2.5 4.

SECTION 9: That Table 414.2.5(3) shall be amended to include the following:
TABLE 414.2.5(3) MAXIMUM ALLOWABLE QUANTITY OF LOW BURNING

VELOCITY CATEGORY 18 FLAMMABLE GAS IN GROUP M AND S OCCUPANCIES
PER CONTROL AREA*

FLAMMABLE MAXIMUM ALLOWABLE QUANTITY PER CONTROL
GAS AREA
CATEGORY . _ _
Sprinklered in Accordance Nonsprinklered
with Note b




Category 1B (Low BV)

Gaseous 390,000 cu. ft. 195,000 cu. ft.

Liquified 40,000 1bs. 20,000 lbs.

For St, 1 pound = 0.454 kg. 1 cubic foot = 00.2832 m3. | square foot = 0.093m2. | inch/second = 2.5641 cmvs.

a. Control areas shall be separated from each other by nor less than 1-hour fire barrier

b. The building shall be equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system with minimum sprinkler
design density of Ordinary Hazard Group 2 in the area where flammable gases are stored or displayed.

c. Where storage areas exceed 50,000 square fect in area, the maximum allowable quantities area allowed to be

increased by 2 percent for each 1,000 square feet of area in excess of 50,000 squate feet, up to not mere than 100
percent of the table amounts. Separation of control areas is not required. The aggregate amount shall not exceed
80,000 pounds.

d. “Low BV” Category 1B flammable gas has a burning velocity of 3.9 in/s (10 em/s) or less,

SECTION 10: That Table 414.5.1 shall be amended to include the following:

TABLE 414.5.1 EXPLOSION CONTROL REQUIREMENTS
EXPLOSION CONTROL METHODS
MATERIAL CLASS Barricade Explosion (deflagration) venting or
construction explosion (deflagration prevention
systems
HAZARD CATEGORY
Combustible dusts - Not Required Required
Cryogenic flammables  --—--- Not required Required
EXPLOSION CONTROL METHODS
MATERIAL CLASS Barricade Explosion (deflagration) venting or
construction explosion (deflagration prevention ;
systems [
HAZARD CATEGORY

Division 1.1 Required Not Required

Division 1.2 Required Not Required

Division 1.3 Not Required Required
Explosives Division 1.4 Not Required Required

Division 1.5 Required Not Required

Division 1.6 Required Not Required
Flammable gas Gaseous Not Required Required

Liquified Not Required Required

-6-




Flammable liquid 1A Not Required Required
1B Not Required Required
Organic peroxides u Required Not Permitted
1 Required Not Permitted
Oxidizer liquids and 4 Required Not Permitted
solids
Pyrophoric gas ~  —-— Not Required Required
Unstable (reactive) 4 Required Not Permitted
3 (Detonable)  Required Not Permitted
3 (Nondetonable) Not Required Required
Water-reactive liquids 3 Not Required Required
and solids 2 Not Required Required
SPECIAL USES
Acetylene generator —- Not Required Required
Tooms
Electrochemical energy = -----
storage system Not Required Required
Energy storage system  -—-- Not Required Required
Grain processing -—- Not Required Required
Liquified petroleum gas  ----- Not Required Required
distribution facilities
Where explosion Detonation Required Not Permitted
hazards exist Deflagration Not Required Required
a See Section 414.1.3.
b. See the International Fire Code.
c. Combustible dusts where manufactured, generated or used in such a manner that the concentration and conditions
create a fire or explosion hazard based on information prepared in accordance with Section 104.2.2 of the
International Fire Code. See definition of “Combustible dust” in Chapter 2.
d. Storage or use.
€. In open use or dispensing.
f. Rooms containing dispensing and usc of hazardous malerials where an explosive environment can occur because
of the characteristics or nature of the hazardous materials or as a result of the dispensing or use process.
e A method of explosion control shall be provided where Class 2 water-reactive materials can form potentially
explosive mixiures.
h. Explosion venting is not required for Group H-5 fabrication areas complying with Section 415.11.1 and the
International Fire Code.
L. Where expiosion control is required in Section 1207 of the International Fire Code.
J- Does not apply to consumer fireworks, Diviston 1.4G.
k. Not required for Category 1B Flammable Gases having a burning velocity not excecding 3.9 inches per second

{10 cm/s).




SECTION 11: That Section 907.1 shall be amended to read as follows:
907.1 General. This section covers the application, installation, performance and maintenance of
fire alarm systems and their components. In addition to the requirements of Section 907,
instaliations shall comply with the Illinois Smoke Detector Act (425 ILCS 60/).

SECTION 12: That Section 907.2.8. shall be amended to read as follows:
907.2.8 Group R-1. Fire alarm systems and smoke alarms shall be installed in Group R-1
occupancies as required in Sections 907.2.8.1 through 907.2.8.3 and the [1linois Smoke Detector Act
(425 ILCS 60/).

SECTION 13: That Section 907.2.9 shall be amended to read as follows:
907.2.9 Group R-2.  Fire alarm systems and smoke alarms shall be installed in Group R-2
occupancies as required in Sections 907.2.9.1 through 907.2.9.3 and the [llinois Smoke Detector Act
(425 ILCS 60/).

SECTION 14: That Section 907.2.11 shall be amended to read as follows:
907.2.11 Single- and multiple-station smoke alarms. Listed single- and multiple-station smoke
alarms complying with UL 217 shall be installed in accordance with Sections 907.2.11.1
through%907.2.11.7, NFPA 72, the manufacturer’s instructions, and the [llinois Smoke Detector Act
(425 ILCS 60/).
Secs. 6-24 - 6-34. Reserved.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village
of South Holland, Cook County, Illinois, that Chapter 6, “Buildings and Building Regulations”,
Article III., “Residential Code™, is hereby inserted and shall read as follows:

ARTICLE III. RESIDENTIAL CODE

There is hereby adopted by the Village the 2021 International Residential Code, as hereinafier
amended.

Passim. Wherever the phrase “[name of jurisdiction]” or the word “jurisdiction” appears, it shall
be deemed to refer to the Village of South Holland.

Passim. Wherever the phrase “code official” or “department of building inspection™ appears, it shall
be deemed to refer to the Viilage of South Holland.

-8-




SECTION 1: That Table R301.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
See Exhibit “B” attached hereto
BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village
of South Holland, Cook County, Illinois, that Chapter 6, “Buildings and Building Regulations”,
Article IT], “Electrical Code™ be renumbered to Article IV., “Electrical Code™, is hereby amended

to read as follows:

ARTICLE IV, ELECTRICAL CODE

TABLE R301.2
CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA

See Exhibit “C” attached hereto
SECTION 1: That Section R314.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

R314.2 Where required. Smoke alarms shall be provided in accordance with this section and the
lllinois Smoke Detector Act (425 ILCS 60/).

SECTION 2: That Section 314.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:
R314.3 Location. Smoke alarms shall be installed in the following locations:
1. In each sleeping room.

2. Outside each separate sleeping area in the immediate vicinity of the bedrooms, but
not further than 15 feet from a room used for sleeping purposes.

3. On each additional story of the dwelling, including basements and habitable attics
and not including crawl spaces and uninhabitable attics. In dwelling or dwelling
units with split levels and without an intervening door between the adjacent levels,
a smoke alarm installed on the upper level shall suffice for the adjacent lower level
provided that the lower level is less than one full story below the upper level.

4, Not less than 3 feet 914 mm) horizontally from the door or opening of a bathroom
that contains a bathtub or shower unless this would prevent placement of a smoke
alarm required by this section.




5. In the hallway and in the room open to the hallway in dwelling units where the
ceiling height of a room open to a hallway serving bedrooms exceeds that of the
hallway by 24 inches (610 mm) or more.

6. Within the room to which a sleeping loft is open, in the immediate vicinity of the
sleeping loft.
7. When installed in the ceiling, the smoke alarm shall be installed at least 6 inches

from a wall, or within an approved location to capture smoke.

8. When installed in a wall, the smoke alarm shall be installed 4 to 6 inches from a
ceiling, or within an approved location to capture smoke.

SECTION3: That Section 6-67, “Electrical commission™, shall be deleted in its entirety and

the following shall be inserted in lieu thereof and shall read as follows:

Sec. 6-67. Reserved.

SECTION4: That Section 6-68, “Adoption of standards” shall be deleted in its entirety and

the following shall be inserted in lieu thereof and shall read as follows:

Sec. 6-68. Adoption of standards.

(a)

(b)

(¢)

Generally. The installation, alteration and use of electrical equipment in the village are
governed by the standards and specifications, rules and regulations recommended by the
electrical commission and adopted by the board. The fees paid for inspection shall be those
recommended by the electrical commission and adopted by the board.

National Electrical Code. The 2023 edition of the National Electrical Code, being the
standard of the American Insurance Association for electric wiring and apparatus as
recommended by the National Fire Protection Association, and as from time to time amended
by American Standards Association, copies of which have been placed on file for more than
thirty (30) days last past with the village clerk, is hereby incorporated in this article and
adopted as to all matters therein covered which are not specifically covered by this article.

Electricity supply company regulations adopted. The Information and Requirements for
Supply of Electrical Services as last adopted by the Public Service Company, Division of
Commonwealth Edison Company, and as last published and filed with the I1linois Commerce
Commission, three (3) copies of which have been placed on file for more than thirty (30)
days last past with the village clerk is hereby incorporated by reference and adopted with

-10-




respect to all matters not specifically covered by this article, or by the National Electrical
Code as from time to time amended.

(d) Permits. Upon the adoption by ordinance of standards and specifications, rules, regulations
and fees, and publication, according to statute, they shall become operative, and no electrical
equipment shall be installed or altered except upon a permit first issued by the electrical
inspection department.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village
of South Holland, Cook County, Illinois, that Chapter 6, “Buildings and Building Regulations™,
Article IV, “Mechanical Code” be renumbered to Article V., “Mechanical Code”, is hereby amended
to read as follows:

SECTION 1: That Section 6-111, “Adoption of mechanical code”, shall be deleted in its
entirety and the following shall be inserted in lieu thereof and shall read as follows:

Sec. 6-111. International Mechanical Code Amendments

There is hereby adopted by the Village the 2021 International Mechanical Code, as
hereinafter amended.

Passim. Wherever the phrase “[name of jurisdiction]” or the word “jurisdiction” appears, they shall
be deemed to refer to the Village of South Holland.

Passim. Wherever the phrase “code official” or “department of building inspection” appears, it shall
be deemed to refer to the Village of South Holland.

SECTION 2: That Section 1101.2.1 is hereby amended to include the following section:

1101.2.1 Group A21., A2, A3 and B1 high-probability equipment. High-probability equipment using
Group A2L, A2, A3 and B1 refrigerant shall comply with UL484, UL/CSA 60335-2-40 or UL/CSA

60335-2-89,
SECTION 3: That Table 1103.1 is amended to read as follows:

TABLE 1103.1
REFRIGERANT CLASSIFICATION, AMOUNT AND OEL

See Exhibit “D” attached hereto

-11-




SECTION 4: That Section 1104.3.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1104.3.1 Air conditioning for human comfort. High-probability systems used for human comfort

shall use Group A1 or A2L refrigerants.

Exceptions:

1.

3.

Equipment listed for and used in residential occupancies containing a maximum of
6.6 pounds (3 kg) of refrigerant.

Equipment listed for and used in commercial occupancies containing a maximum of
22 pounds (10 kg) of refrigerant.

Industrial occupancies.

SECTION S: That Section 1104.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1104.3.2 Group A2. A3. B2 and B3 refrigerants. Group A2 and B2 refrigerants shall not be used in
high-probability systems. Group A3 and B3 refrigerants shall not be used except where approved.

Exceptions:

1.

This section does not apply to:

Laboratories where the floor area per occupant is not less than 100 square feet (9.3
m?).

Listed self-contained systems having a maximum of 0.331 (150 g) of Group A3
refrigerants.

Industrial occupancies.

Equipment listed for and used in residential occupancies containing a maximum of
6.6 pounds (3 kg) of Group A2 and B2 refrigerant.

Equipment listed for and used in commercial occupancies containing a maximum of
22 pounds (10 kg) of Group A2 and B2 refrigerant.

SECTION 6: That Table 1104.3.2. shall be deleted in its entirety.

SECTION 7: That Section 1106.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1106.3 Class 2 and 3 refrigerants. Where refrigerants of Groups A2, A3, B2 and B3 are used, the
machinery room shall conform to the Class I, Division 2, hazardous location classification
requirements of NFPA 70.




SECTION 8: That Section 1106.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1106.4 Group A2 and B2L refrigerant. Machinery rooms for Group A2L and B2L refrigerant shall
comply with Section 1106.4.1 through Section 1106.4.3.

SECTION 9: That Section 1106.4.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1106.4.1 Elevated temperatures. Open flame-producing devices or continuously operating hot
surfaces over 12900F (7000C) shall not be permanently installed in the room.

SECTION 10: That Section 1106.4.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1106.4.2 Refrigerant detector. Inaddition to the requirements of Section 1105.3, refrigerant detector
shall signal an alarm and activate the ventilation system in accordance with the response time
specified in Table 1106.4.2.

SECTION 11: That Table 1106.4.2 is hereby amended to include a revised version as

follows:
TABLE 1106.4.2
GROUP A2L AND B2L DETECTOR ACTIVATION
Activation Level Maximum Response Time | ASHRAE 15 Ventilation Alarm Reset Alarm
(seconds) Level Tvpe
Less than or equal to the OEL in 300 1 Automatic Trouble
Table 1203.1
Less than or equal to the 15 2 Manual Emergency
refrigerant concentration level in
Table 1203.1

SECTION 12: That Section 1106.4.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1106.4.3 Mechanical ventilation. The machinery room shall have a mechanical ventilation system
complying with ASHRAE 15.

SECTION 13: That Table 1107.4 is hereby amended to include a revised version as follows:

TABLE 1107.4

REFRIGERANT PIPE
Piping Material Standard
Aluminum tube ASTM 8210/ASTM 8210M, ASTM 8491/8491M

-13-




Brass (copper alloy) pipe ASTM 843

Copper linesets ASTM 8280, ASTM 81003
Copper pipe ASTM 842, ASTM 8302
Steel pipe

Steel tube

SECTION 14: That Table 1107.5 is hereby amended to include a revised version as follows:

TABLE 1107.5

REFRIGERANT PIPE FITTINGS
Fitting Material Standard
Aluminum ASTM 8361

Copper and Copper Alloy (Brass) | ASME 816.15, ASME 816.18, ASME 816.22, ASME 816.24, ASME
816.26m ASME §16.50

Steel ASTM A108, ASTM A181, ASTM A193, ASTM A234, ASTM A420,
ASTM A707

SECTION 15: That Section 1107.7 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1107.7 Flexible connectors. expansion and vibration compensators. Flexible connectors and
expansion and vibration control devices shall be listed and labeled for use in refrigerant systems and
pressures for which the components are installed.

SECTION 16: That Section 1109.2.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1109.2.2 Refrigerant pipe enclosure. Refrigerant piping shall be protected by locating it within the
building elements or within protective enclosures.

1. Where installed without ready access or located more than 7 feet 3 inches (2210 mm)
above the finished floor.

2. Where located within 6 feet (1829 mm) of the refrigerant unit or appliance.
3. Where located in a machinery room complying with Section 1105,
4. Outside the building:

4.1 Where protected from damage from the weather, including but not limited to
hail, ice and snow loads.

-14-




4.2 Where protected from damage within the expected foot or traffic path.

4.3 Where installed underground not less than 8 inches (200 mm) below finished
grade and protected against corrosion.

SECTION 16: That Section 1109.2.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1109.2.3 Prohibited locations. Refrigerant piping shall not be installed in any of the following
locations:

1. Exposed within a fire-resistance-rated exit access corridor.

2. Exposed within an interior exit stairway.

3. Within an interior exit ramp.

4. Within an exit passageway.

5. Within an elevator, dumbwaiter or other shaft containing a moving object.

SECTION 17: That Section 1109.2.6 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1109.2.6 Exposed piping surface temperature. Exposed piping having surface temperatures greater
than 1200F (490C) or less than 5OF (-150C) with ready access to nonauthorized personnel shall
be protected from contact or shall have thermal insulation that limits the exposed insulation surface
temperature to a range of 50F (-150C) to 1200F (490C).

SECTION 18: That Section 1109.2.7 is hereby amended tor read as follows:

1109.2.7 Pipe identification. Refrigerant pipe located in areas other than the room or space where
the refrigerating equipment is located shall be identified., The pipe identification shall be located at
intervals not exceeding 20 feet (6096 mm) on the refrigerant piping or pipe insulation. The
minimum height of lettering of the identification label shall be % inch (12.7 mm). The identification
shall indicate the refrigerant designation and safety group classification of refrigerant used in the
piping system. For Group A2L and B2L refrigerants, the identification shall also include the
following statement: “WARNING - Risk of Fire, Flammable Refrigerant.” For Group A2, A3, B2
and B3 refrigerants, the identification shall also include the following statement: “DANGER - Risk
of Fire or Explosion, Flammable Refrigerant.” For any Group B refrigerant, the identification shall
also include the following statement: “DANGER - Toxic Refrigerant.”

SECTION 19: That Section 1109.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1109.3 Installation requirements for Group A2L. A2. A3. B2L. B2 or B3 refrigerant. Piping systems

-15-




using Group A2L, A2, A3, B2L, B2 or B3 refrigerant shall comply with the requirements of Sections
11093.1 and 1109.3.2.

SECTION 20: That Section 1109.3.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1109.3.1 Protection against physical damage. In addition to the requirements of Section 305.5,
aluminum, copper and steel tube used for Group A2, A3, B2 and B3 refrigerants and located in
concealed locations where tubing is installed in studs, joists, rafters or similar member spaces, and
located less than 11/4 inches (32 mm) from the nearest edge of the member, shall be continuously
protected by shield plates. Protective steel shield plates shall cover the area of the tube plus the area
extending not less than 2 inches (51 mm) beyond both sides of the tube.

SECTION 21: That Section 1109.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

1109.3.2 Shaft ventilation. Refrigerant pipe shafts with systems using Group 21 or B2L refrigerant
shall be naturally or mechanically ventilated. Refrigerant pipe shafts with one or more systems using
any Group A2, A3, B2 or B3 refrigerant shall be continuously mechanically ventilated and shall
include a refrigerant detector. The shaft ventilation exhaust outlet shall comply with Section
501.3.1. Naturally ventilated shafts shall have a pipe, duct or conduit not less than 4 inches (102
mm) in diameter that connects to the lowest point of the shaft and extends to the outdoors. The pipe,
duct or conduit shall be level or pitched downward to the outdoors. Mechanically ventilated shafts
shall have a minimum airflow velocity in accordance with Table 1109.3.2. The mechanical
ventilation shall be continuously operated or activated by a refrigerant detector. Systems utilizing
a refrigerant detector shall activate the mechanical ventilation at a maximum refrigerant
concentration of 25 percent of the lower flammable limit of the refrigerant. The detector, or a
sampling tube that draws air to the detector, shall be located in an area where refrigerant from a leak
will concentrate. The shaft shall not be required to be ventilated for double-wall refrigerant pipe
where the interstitial space of the double-wall pipe is vented to the outdoors.

SECTION 22: That Section 1109.4 shall be deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 23: That Section 1109.4.1 shall be deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 24: That Section 1109.4.2 shail be deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 25: That Section 1109.7 shall be deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 26: That Section 1110.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:
1110.3 Field test gases. The medium used for field pressure testing the refrigeration system shall

be one of the following inert gases: oxygen-free nitrogen, helium argon or premixed nonflammable
oxygen-free nitrogen with a tracer gas of hydrogen or helium. For R-744 refrigeration systems,

-16-




carbon dioxide shall be allowed as the test medium. For R-718 refrigeration systems, water shall
be allowed as the test medium.

SECTION 27: That Section 1110.3.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:
1110.3.1 Test gases not permitted. Oxygen, air, refrigerants other than those identified in Section

1110.3, combustible gases and mixtures containing such gases shall not be used as the pressure test
medium.

SECTION 28: That Section 1110.5.1 shall be deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 29: That Section 1110.5.2 shall be deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 30: That Section 1110.6 shall be deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 31: That Section 1110.7 shall be deleted in its entirety.
SECTION 32: That Chapter 15 (Referenced Standards) shall be amended as follows:
1. Under the heading of ASHRAE, revise to adopt the following by reference:
I. 15-2022 Safety Standard for Refrigeration Systems
2. 34-2022 Designation and Safety Classification of Refrigerants
2. Under the heading of ASTM, revise to adopt A333-18 Standard Specification
for Seamless and Welded Steel Pipe for Low-Temperature and Other

Applications with required Notch Toughness.

Where reference is made to the ICC International Energy Conservation Code,
see the [llinois Energy Conservation Code adopted by the State of Illinois.

ol

4. Where reference is made to the ICC International Plumbing Code, see the
Illinois Plumbing Code adopted by the State of Illinois.

5. Under the heading of UL, revise to adopt the following by reference:
1. UL/CSA 60335-2-40 2022 Household and Similar Electrical
Appliances-Safety-Part 2-40; Particular Requirements for Electrical

Heat Pumps, Air-Conditioners and Dehumidifiers.

2. UL/CSA  60335-2-89 2021 Household and Similar Electrical
Appliances-Safety-Part  2-89; Particular Requirements for

-17-




Commercial Refrigerating Appliances with an Incorporated or
Remote Refrigerant Unit or Compressor.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village
of South Hollénd, Cook County, Illinois, that Chapter 6, “Buildings and Building Regulations”,
Article V, “Existing Structures” be L;enumbered to Article VL., “Existing Structures”, is hereby
amended to read as follows: |

ARTICLE V1. EXISTING STRUC;I‘URES
DIVISION 1. GENERALLY

SECTION 1: That Section 6-131, “Adoption of property maintenance code”, shall be
deleted in its entirety and the following shall be inserted in lieu thereof and shall read as follows:
Sec. 6-131. International Existing Building Code Amendments

There is hereby adopted by the Village the 2021 International Existing Building Code, as
hereinafter amended.

Passim. Wherever the phrase “[name of jurisdiction]” or the word “jurisdiction” appears, they shall
be deemed to refer to the Village of South Holland.

Passim. Wherever the phrase “code official” or “department of building inspection™ appears, it shall
be deemed to refer to the Viilage of South Holland.

SECTION2: That Seé. 6-132, International Property Maintenance Code Amendments” shall
be added and shall read as follows:

There is hereby adopted by the Village the 2021 International Property Maintenance Code,
as hereinafter amended. '

Passim. Wherever the phrase “[name of jurisdiction]” or the word “jurisdiction” appears, they shall
be deemed to refer to the Village of South Holland.

Passim. Wherever the phrase “code official” or “department of building inspection” appears, it shall
be deemed to refer to the Village of South Holland.

-18-




SECTION 3: That Section 202 shall be amended to include the following definitions:

DEVICE, ELECTRICAL. A unitofanelectrical system, other than a conductor, that
carries or controls electric energy as its principal function.

MULTIPLE-STATION ALARM. A single-station alarm capable of being
interconnected to one or more additional alarms so that the actuation of one causes
the appropriate alarm signal to operate in all interconnected alarms.

SINGLE-STATION ALARM. A detector comprising an assembly that incorporates
sensor, control components, and an alarm notification appliance in one unit operated
from a power source either located in the unit or obtained at the point of installation.
SECTION 4: That Section 304.14, Insect screens, shall be amended by adding the following
dates “from April 1* to November 1*.

SECTION 5: That Section 305.7 is hereby created and shall read as follows:

305.7 Interior moisture control. The following steps shall be taken to limit excessive
moisture within a rental dwelling unit:

1. All habitable areas shall be kept dry and free from exterior moisture
penetration.
2. Building components within the interior, including concealed spaces and

cavities that become wet shall be adequately dried to prevent mold growth.

3. Allinterior areas of the dwelling unit shall be kept free from exterior standing
water entering the building. Measures shall be taken in compliance with
Section 302.2 to address standing water contacting the building components
and permeable building components.

4. Free standing and attached garages shall be kept free from excessive moisture
within the structure.

SECTION 6: That Section 305.8 is hereby created and shall read as follows:

305.8 Window coverings. Where window coverings are provided, they shall have all exterior
facing glazing panels or windows equipped with blinds, shades, drapes, or curtains. Any
other materials applied to obstruct or cover the glazing panel or window is prohibited all
window coverings shall be kept in good repair.

-19-




SECTION 7: That Section 404.4.4 is hereby amended to read as follows:

404.4.4 Prohibited occupancy. Kitchens, living rooms, family rooms, dining rooms, and
other nonhabitable spaces shall not be used for sleeping purposes.

SECTION 8: That Section 602.3, Heat Supply, shall be amended by adding the following
dates “from October 1 to May 15" «.

SECTION9: That Section 602.4, Occupiable work spaces, shall be amended by adding the
following dates “from October 1* to May 15® ™.

SECTION 10: That Section 603.7 is hereby created and shall read as follows:

603.7 Exhaust discharge. Domestic cooking exhaust equipment within a rental dwelling

shall discharge to the outdoors through a duct. The duct shall have a smooth interior surface,

shall be airtight, shall be equipped with a backdraft damper and shall be independent of all

other exhaust systems. Ducts serving domestic cooking exhaust equipment shall not
terminate in an attic or crawl space or areas inside the building.

SECTION 11: That Section 604.4 is hereby created and shall read as follows:

604.4 Ground-Fault Circuit-Interrupter (GFCI). Within a dwelling or dwelling unit GFCI
protection installed under the adopted edition of the National Electrical Code shall be
maintained and operational in compliance with the product listing. Where a GFCI protection
device is no longer operational, the device shall be immediately replaced.

SECTION 12: That Section 604.5 is hereby created and shall read as follows:

604.5 Arc Fault Circuit-Interrupter (AFCI). Within a dwelling or dwelling unit AFCI
protection installed under the adopted edition of the National Electrical Code shall be
maintained and operational in compliance with the product listing. Where a AFCI protection
device 1s no longer operational, the device shail be immediately replaced.

SECTION 13: That Section 702.4.1 is hereby created and shall read as follows:

702.4.1 Rental dwelling unit escape and rescue openings. Existing rental dwelling units shall

have emergency escape and rescue openings in compliance with the adopted edition of the
International Residential Code. Rental house escape and rescue openings that were legally
maodified under the 2018 International Residential Code are not required to update to the
current code. Approved permanently installed platforms and steps meeting current building
codes may be used to meet the sill height requirement.

20-




Exception:

Where the creation of the escape and rescue opening is not structurally feasible, The Building
Official may alter this requirement to meet the intent or waive this requirement.

SECTION 14: That Section 704.6.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

704.6.1 Where required. Existing Group I-1 and R occupancies shall be provided with
single-station smoke alarms in accordance with Sections 704.6.1.1 through 704.6.1.4.
Interconnection and power sources shail be in accordance with Sections 704.6.2 and 704.6.3.

SECTION 15: That Section 704.6.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

704.6.2 Interconnection. Where more than one smoke alarm is required to be installed within
an individual dwelling or sleeping unit, the smoke alarms shall be interconnected in such a
manner that the activation of one alarm will activate all of the alarms in the individual unit.
Physical interconnection of smoke alarms shall not be required where listed wireless alarms
are installed and all alarms sound upon activation of one alarm. The alarm shall be clearly
audible in all bedrooms over background noise levels with all intervening doors closed.

Exceptions:

1. Interconnection is not required in buildings that are not undergoing
alterations, repairs or construction of any kind.

2. Smoke alarms in existing areas are not required to be interconnected where
alterations or repairs do not result in the removal of interior wall or ceiling
finishes exposing the structure, unless there is an attic, crawl space or
basement available that could provide access for interconnection without the
removal of interior finishes.

3. Rental dwellings - “Exceptions™ are not applicable.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village
of South Holland, Cook County, Illinois, that Chapter 6, “Buildings and Building Regulations”,
Division 3, “Boarding” shall be amended to be entitled “Board-Up”, and Section 6-159 shall be

deleted in its entirety and the following shall be inserted and shall read as follows:

21-




DIVISION 3. BOARD-UP
Sec. 6-159.  Defined.

Every owner or occupant of any structure shall be responsible for keeping all windows and
doors of such structures, whether occupied or not, enclosed by materials ordinarily and customarily
used either by builders or contractors or manufactured for such purposes, and shall not permit
enclosure by board up, closing up or other means except in the event such structure is damaged by
glass breakage or vandalism; in which event, one-half-inch wire mesh screening may be instailed
over the window or door after the broken glass or damaged door has been replaced. All board up
must be painted white on the exterior facing side of the board.

Should a structure be damaged by fire, tornado or similar catastrophe, the owner or occupant
shall be permitted to board the windows and doors of such structure, as may be required, for a period
of not to exceed sixty (60) days, and shall, prior to the expiration of such time, make the required
repairs and installations in the customary and usual manner; provided, however, that the president
and board of trustees may authorize an extension of such period when presented with good and
sufficient reasons by the owner or occupant for the failure to remove such boarding.

Every owner or occupant of a structure which shall be in violation of this section upon its
effective date shall have ninety (90) days from said effective date to comply with the provisions of
this section.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village
of South Holland, Cook County, Illineis, that Chapter 6, “Buildings and Building Regulations”,
Article VI, “House Drains; Sewers” be renumbered to Article VIL., “House Drains; Sewers.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village
of South Holland, Cook County, Illineis, that Chapter 6, “Buildings and Building Regulations”,
Article VII, “Fences” be renumbered to Article VIII., “Reserved”.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village
of South Holland, Cook County, Illinois, that Chapter 6, “Buildings and Building Regulations™,
Sec. 6-196 to and including Sec. 6-201 are hereby deleted in their entirety and Secs. 6-202-6-215

shall be inserted and shall read as follows:

2.




Secs. 6-202 - 6-215. Reserved.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village
of South Holland, Cook County, Illinois, that Chapter 6, “Buildings and Building Regulations”,
Article VIII, “Swimming Pools” be renumbered to Article 1X., “Swimming Pools”, and shall be
amended to read as follows:

SECTION 1: That Sec. 6-216, entitled “Adoption of swimming pool code”, is hereby
deleted in its entirety and the following shall be inserted in lieu thereof:

ARTICLE IX. SWIMMING POOLS

Sec. 6-216.  Adoption of swimming pool code.

A certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the village clerk of
the Village of South Holland being marked and designated a the International Swimming Pool and
Spa Code (2021) be and is hereby adopted as the swimming pool code of the Village of South
Holland of the State of IHlinois, for the control of the buildings and structures as herein provided; and
each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said International
Swimming Pool and Spa Code are hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof as if fully set
out in this section.

There is hereby adopted by the Village the 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code,
as hereinafter amended.

Passim. Wherever the phrase *“[name of jurisdiction]” or the word “jurisdiction” appears, they shall
be deemed to refer to the Village of South Holland.

Passim. Wherever the phrase “code official” or “department of building inspection” appears, it shall
be deemed to refer to the Village of South Holland.

SECTION2: That Sec. 6-217, entitled “Compliance with article required” is hereby deleted

in its entirety and the following shall be inserted in lieu thereof:

23




Sec. 6-217. Compliance with article required.

It shall be unlawful to construct, maintain, install or enlarge any swimming pool in the
village, except in compliance with all the provisions of this article and the adopted edition of the
International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.

SECTION 3: That Sec. 6-219, entitled “Drawings and plans™ is hereby deleted in its entirety
and the following shall be inserted in lieu thereof:

Sec. 6-219. Drawings and plans.

Construction documents shall be prepared and submitted in compliance with the adopted
edition of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.

SECTION 4: That Sec. 6-221, entitled “Recirculation pools™is hereby deleted in its entirety
and the following shail be inserted in lieu thereof:
Sec. 6-221. Recirculation pools.

Swimming pools and spas shall be designed and installed in compliance with the adopted
edition of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.

SECTION 5: That Sec. 6-222, entitled “Construction specifications, materials” is hereby
deleted in its entirety and the following shall be inserted in licu thereof:
Sec. 6-222. Construction specifications, materials.

Swimming pools and spas shall be constructed in compliance with the adopted edition of the
International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.

SECTION 6: That Sec. 6-223, entitled “Structural design”™ is hereby deleted in its entirety
and the following shall be inserted in lieu thereof:
Sec. 6-223. Structural design.

Swimming pools and spas shall be designed in compliance with the adopted edition of the

International Swimming Pool and Spa Code and the International Building Code to resist all imposed
loads.

24




SECTION 7: That Sec. 6-224, entitled “Walk areas™ is hereby deleted in its entirety and the
tollowing shall be inserted in lieu thereof:
Sec. 6-224. Walk areas.

Unobstructed walk areas and not less than thirty-six (36) inches wide shall be provided to
extend entirely around the pool. The walking area or pool deck shall be constructed in compliance
with the adopted edition of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.

SECTION 8: That Sec. 6-225, entitled “Fences” is hereby deleted in its entirety and the
following shall be inserted in lieu thereof:

Sec. 6-225. Fences.

Barrier protection around swimming poois and spas shall be in accordance with the adopted
edition of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code. Where a conflict occurs within the

fencing requirements of the municipality and the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code, the
more restrictive fencing or barrier provisions shall govern.

SECTION 9: That Sec. 6-226, entitled “Steps or ladders” is hereby deleted in its entirety and
the following shall be inserted in lieu thereof:
Sec. 6-226. Steps or ladders.

Access to enter a swimming pool or spa shall be in compliance with the adopted edition of
the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.

SECTION 10: That Sec. 6-227, entitled “Skimmers” is hereby deleted in its entirety and the
following shall be inserted in lieu thereof:
Sec. 6-227. Skimmers.

Swimming pool skimmers and anti-entrapment devices shall be in compliance with the
adopted edition of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.

SECTION 11: That Sec. 6-229, entitled “Inlets™ is hereby deleted in its entirety and the

following shall be inserted in lieu thereof:




Sec. 6-229. Inlets.

The swimming pool or spa piping and circulation system shall comply with the adopted
edition of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.

SECTION 12: That Sec. 6-230, entitled “Outlets” is hereby deleted in its entirety and the
following shall be inserted in lieu thereof:
Sec. 6-230. Outlets.

(a) The swimming pool or spa piping and circulation system shall comply with the
adopted edition of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.

(b Water drained from the pool shall not be discharged to the sewer system during
periods of rain or storms. At no time shall the rate of drain water discharge exceed
a flow of two hundred (200) gallons per minute.
SECTION 13: That Sec. 6-231, entitled “Recirculation system and appurtenances” is hereby
deleted in its entirety and the following shall be inserted in lieu thereof:

Sec. 6-231. Recirculation system and appurtenances.

The swimming pool or spa recirculation system shall comply with the adopted edition of the
International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.

SECTION 14: That Sec. 6-232, entitled “Electrical requirements” is hereby deleted in its
entirety and the following shall be inserted in lieu thereof:
Sec. 6-232. Electrical requirements,

All electrical installations shall meet the requirements of the adopted editions of the
International Swimming Pool and Spa Code and National Electrical Code. No swimming pool
installation shall be allowed without the prior approval for location from Commonwealth Edison
Company.

SECTION 15: That Sec. 6-233, entitled “Safety Precautions” is hereby deleted in its entirety

and the following shall be inserted in lieu thereof:

26-




Sec. 6-233. Safety precautions.

Swimming pools and spas shall meet the safety requirements prescriptively required by the
adopted edition of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.

SECTION 16: That Sec. 6-234, entitled “Inspection” is hereby deleted in its entirety and the
following shall be inserted in lieu thereof:
Sec. 6-234. Inspection.

Inspections for swimming pools and spas constructed within the Village of South Holland
shall be in compliance with this chapter, adopted edition of the International Swimming Pool and
Spa Code, and any applicable adopted code relating to the design.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village
of South Hoelland, Cook County, Illinois, that Chapter 6, “Buildings and Building Regulations™,
Article IX, “Sewer Use and Sewer Charge” be renumbered to Article X.. “Sewer Use and Sewer
Charge”.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village
of South Holland, Cook County, Illinois, that Chapter 6, “Buildings and Building Regulations™,
Article X, “Landscaping” be renumbered to Article XI., “Landscaping”.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village
of South Holland, Cook County, Illinois, that Chapter 6, “Buildings and Building Regulations”,
Article XI, “Basketball Standards™ be renumbered to Article XII., “Basketball Standards”.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village

of South Holland, Cook County, Illineis, that Chapter 6, “Buildings and Building Regulations™,

Article XII, “Plants and Weeds™ be renumbered to Article XIII., “Plants and Weeds™.

27-




BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village
of South Holland, Cook County, Illinois, that Chapter 6, “Buildings and Building Regulations”,
Article XIII, “Certificate of Payment” be renumbered to Article XIV., “Certificate of Payment™.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village
of South Holland, Cook County, Illinois, that Chapter 6, “Buildings and Building Regulations™,
Article XIV, “Gatherings in Residential Areas” be renumbered to Article XV. “Gatherings in
Residential Areas™.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that if any provision of this ordinance or application
thereof to any person or circumstance shall be held invalid, such invalidity shall not affect other
provisions or application of this Ordinance which can be given effect without the invalid provision
or application and, to this end, the provisions of this Ordinance are declared to be severable.

The above and foregoing Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its
adoption, approval and publication, as provided by law. Publication in pamphlet form is authorized.

Adopted by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village of South Holland, Cook

County, Illinois, at a meeting legally assembled on the 13" day of January, 2026, on motion of

Trustee EujSELL , seconded by Trustee:g—_;gmk, carried on the aye votes of Trustees
Neouas , Nyren, Russew, Jomsm , Res

Voting nay: O Absent: MQ&Q
fmf‘ﬁc&&\,& PO g

Village Clerk
APPRQVE
é)zfﬂ &

Village President /

Passed: 13/ b ale
Approved:  V/13/Jdalp
Published in pamphlet form: L/A/ 902 (o



IIA"

EXEIBIT

. GROURWHEH THE MAYINUM Jremseen L DR (T I |
WATERIAL | €SS | AUOWABLEQUANTTYIS. | Sodpounds catons | Gasieutic | Sotid pounas Gasfoutls | Sovd pounds- | Liquicgsitons
. excesnED | cusicreey feetatMIP) | foublotoet) festetNIPY- | (outictet) | - (pounds)
1Aand 1B . =
: : : oD 1,000 :
JHigh BVY w2 na NA NA N NA A
Fiimmaie | 13 0owbBvy | 162,500 162,5000
| pas Liguified .
1Aand 18 ‘
{160y : fisops )
PRET L he NA NA NA NA NA NA
Blwavy | {10,000 £10,000)2
Jnm.“-n:!naﬂ-o.ﬁn.:u.__uaqi-;.ﬂ._!ﬁn-u. L.
ZP...ZSEHE;EZQEI. D= Uncleasitied Datonable
n__ﬂ.ﬁ.aﬂisr-l_.a:.uuﬁe.a.spr . : :
2pgogats ndwtorge excad the quantivy liated for storage,
. The GUaris falcuhots g Tk e eed e

uantiin o iedlcines. oqdsmuts, coneumes orinthsectal

Peodons, "

gﬂi:i!sai;?g!gg_:!&sgsiigé _hﬁ_giin_-i:i_ﬂiggss
andy coetein i
£1.3

] ¥ SRLAION Or sanitcion of equipmant. Sworage conteinss and e B!..E_o-ﬂ_.:&-

. _.znniiso‘clﬂ.iz»guizlagjt;sasiuiasét?gns_ngl?-H ks i3 natknown, 28 of the gresw welght of i Mrownrkis,
. P

v ia, inoluding packeging, sheil be ugad,
Pm!.‘.ﬂasg&sggﬂgsssgsliggnhauﬁ temational Fim Carta, .

m“gn#!oirl!?l%!;_ns.

. a?s&.ﬂiﬁ.n!;lsuicz!g.;zﬂaagé&i&n&?ﬂ;ﬂp.t?ﬁk&.i:ﬁnr )
o u ]

i.!gv!!@!!i!ggiiigiﬂi-ﬂ?

u.ggygiigi?%!?qggalg.

bpﬁniqiiiiiaiggigggnﬂg
a.g.laa!eaaigﬂiasu oanoAntIGion

MANAM N the
aiiﬂ‘g.u?islual-iﬁg greator

o nls.lnnnaln-?ﬂgﬁsggggggﬁgrsﬁg:atb
ian.os.ruanzs.Hﬁnﬁgaigﬂ_nﬁa!oginﬂanpgugRGE.




-

EXHIBIT "B"

Lo Tl wied
g. .?”" dislirls 300 !
T ] [ -# - - |
o . Y T
T
e ; [ . o
. I s N ] \ (]

““lﬁwﬂ“ .
wwﬂmm1 ity ookt n T ot

WM‘%#M!;W&
) mﬂwmmmhmmwm-—mun-m
mmumuﬂmmmnmmmm
matmm-“ﬁ—ﬂmmmﬂmﬂnw

) 'wmﬂﬁu—mm“ﬂﬂ-—m;wma_“m
Wﬁw u—. gy Sy s LA,

W mwum_gmmmummwm&mana
. ,mwmummmmm ationad G s Ovetms
" 0 NN aha O W S 0 A 0 S i A i T e St Dt vl AR TN 5 R I TS Wi (R 778 :
T T e ok vt el e e o

i amenriben m&*ﬂmmmwmummnam‘wnmnm

u——imhmmmwuam_wmmm
. muﬂaummammwﬁ—mwww .
' nmhﬂmmmmmnm :




EXHIBIT "cC"

CHAPTER 3 BUILDING PLANNING

. . TABLER30L.2 - ,
CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA

" SUBJECT TO :

GROUND WIND DESIGN seismic DEsicN | PAMAGE PROM | ICEBARRIER | FLOOD| AR MEAN
SNOW Yonograp| Speclal Weat] Frost [Ter] UNMDERLAYMENT |[HAZARD|EREEZING| ANMUA!
Loape [Speed|TOROGraR) Spack Windborno CATEGORY! | o] Ima |mit| REQUIREDD s¢ | INDEX' | TEMP)

(miph} ctsk | reglont | debris zone™ ph bt ac
affe glon ) g |depthP| ¢
254t 1o NO NO ND 8 Sevare | 427 | Yes Yeu Note# 1423 0.6
i MANUAL ) DESIGN CRITERJIAD
Altlitude Indoor winter  [indoor winter design ;
Elevation ) correctlon na__._n__un“h._w—_u.n_“ wet deslgn dry-bulb dry-bulb Outdaor ﬁwﬁﬂ-ﬁ”&mﬁ dry-bult Imﬁﬁmﬂ%ﬂﬁ%ﬂ« ature
Factor? temperature temperature
.1 0.088 73 70 70 ] 70
Indoar summear Indoor summear
Summar design Qutdoar summer deslgn dry- | Cooling temperature
Latltude Dally range| deslgn relative gains design dry-bulb buth temperature differenca
humidlty . temperature
# Matlurs L% I 75 [ 1)

Rate ¥#1: Refer 1o the Village of South Helland Municipal Coda

For §1: 1 pound per aquars fant @ 0.0475 kPa, 1 mils por hour = 0.447 nus.

»Whara 3 Ty ahigher Il wr grade of mavenry than nacesrary to astiaty the strustural requirsmante of this cods, the frast Hine deplh 'l pulced for ahall goves.
The waathering coturs shaki he Eibed In with the Waathering Index, “negTigible” ‘moderats” or ‘sevam’” for concrats s» determined from Figues R301,2{%) The grada of masonry units shall ks determined Fom
ASTM CM, ASTM C55, ASTM CAZ, ASTM CT2, ABTH €90, ASTM 120, ASTM C14%, ASTM 0218 or ASTH C652, .

b¥¥hara the frost line dapth requires desper footings than Indicated In Figuee R403.1(1), the frowt line dupth
with the mindrium dapth of fouting below finish grade.

ghh raquired for shat| Boc!n...-.-_a-sq.q-u_n:g-.-__ Tt In the fraa! fine depth column

T Juriddiction st TIllin thiw part of the tshle to Indicats the nasd for protsction dapending oi whather thera lias bastia history of [ocal subtarranaan termita damage.

“.J_-!ﬁﬂn.na._ﬁ—_gn: [0y this part of tha tabla with the wind speed from the baalc wing spaad g [Figure RI01.2(2). Wind y shull ba di g on A sitaspaciBe hasks (n ‘with
aoilan 5 b

aThe jurisdiction shall Al in this section of the tabis to establish tha design citerta Using Table 10A from ACCA Manual J or esiabiishsd critwria detsrmined by the jurisdiction.
FThs Jurisdiction ahall 08 in this part of the table with the sstumlc design catepory detarminad from Saction R301.2.2.9.

n..:i__.q_-.._n.._a.: -_..__a_:::._-vn:o—zip-z.ﬁ.z"s- 1-32_5-_:.-&33..9:&.:55- :-5..:! Flood msurance Program EE-!. adoption of the firt cade ar ordinance for managsmeny 6f flood hazand
arews); srid the Uie and dete of the cumently eifsciive Flsod Inswance Siudy or other flaad haard study and maps by the y having 1) d .

huin scoordsnow with Bactions RE05.1.2, RE0S.42.1, RSOE.S..1, ROON.6.3.1, RIOS.7.A.1 and R06.0.3.1, wivers hare s beun & hlatsry of local damags from fis sffects of ica dammiig, Ure jurlsdiction shell i In
this part of the talila with "YES." Otherwias, the Jurisdiciion shall fill in this part of tha tabis with “HO,”

L7he Jurisdlotion whall Il In thie part of ihe table with the 100-year rattan perled alr fresxing Index {8F-daya] from Figure R403.3{2) ar fram the 190ear (98 percon .a-._.i on the Nallohsf Glimatic Dats Center data
table "Alr Franzing Index-USA Method Base 32°F),"

LTha Jurisifiotion stmtl fli i this pant of ihe tebla with th annust from the Climafic Puta Conter data fable “Alr Fresaing Index-U8A Method {Base 32*F)."

kAn accordance with Section RIS 21,8, where there Is loost historios! data tural damage to dunt graphis wind spasd.up aWacls, the ahall 11ll {n this part of the tabla
With "VES," Othuewise, the jurlsdiofion shall indicate “NO” Inthls part of the tablas,

Lin escardance with Figure R301.2(2), where there Is local histodical dal docummnting unusual wind conditions, the jurldiction shall filt in this part of tva tahle with “YE5™ and Identfy any apecific requirements.
Otherwiss, the [urisdiction shaf? Indlcats “NO” In this patt of tha tehle.

m.in caordance with Section R301.2:4.2 the jurlediclion whall Indicate the wind-barns debids wind zonola). ) the tiak Indoute "NO" In this part of the tabls.
n.The jun shall i in fons of the tabis to 1iha desigr: criteria using Yahia 1a or 1b from ACCA Manual J or critasia d by the

©.The juriadiction shall fill In thiv settion of the tabls using the Greund Snow Louds [n Figures RI0A.2{3) midt R3O, 2{4).



M

E{HIBIT "“D"

AANNIT OF REFRGERAT PE2 QEOED 93 |
3
cimen: — B oabres
e 45
- i N
Im" - ) o0 Tt
Im« i SN "”.’““'.
Iusws 2 P Jea oo
s ™ Lepanomrue B e foz s
o o et = Lﬂ“'iﬂ' om [P0
= oz [omimenetas - [ e I’W"Iﬂ’ o pos®
Im IR URSERAY PR 472 | .y _ 00 f2008
k,u i~ A - F |- -
Lu =1 Colsatigomstiges = "k 3
e o SN -werramuiamsn N TPO RN ¥ E;ﬂ ik (S g bvo es
I O iy = o o o
. F&l - = = = = =
|n-m e = - rrr ’%ﬂl i
l:m*: oot Iﬂfﬂ.’.ﬁ b iy o | o oo
: Is-m‘- CaryCIF: m ag o %3 me iy ml"‘“”
‘mus [Ery [wrmesaein " 7 e -
T bR T =




[

H| HHHHARHREH AR NREN RS
. HEIHEEINIERNE mmm.mwhmfmmm}m &l
L RIA YA i .
IEIEIENETE 18 |
: =] . 3y ) Gk . .
| 5 &) o] slaal ofe) slslslalealals] al s Jz|alalalsg al
DR HHOHHINEHEHHDADAEEE OO TER
Al 2lotatSlafouald) slof alnlal srelal ol ol alelalels
il | IHHHE
m m i | m
i mmwmww _Lm.wlmw mmmw |
IHHHHHHRHEHHHUHAHNEEERRRARE
ol elslelelalalelsl el dallalslelsl ol d lslalelsl o5




Eﬂ Jn—wmwssm. 2 k7 [nm fos |nenbodion]
I‘l‘"’* R e » ) Jraon froct
IS O T TR T =
- oee [P e n oo o frach
I:i ey kwmnm:sm Jua Iu !m = |- fem fro0
— I&mmm - Iv Ismlm I"“*“"
| - borge  psnsamamns fu ke Pl |
oo | T In-:zmmm pt Fzmh 1 o |-
b i  von Imwa&mms.m " s I”‘”I”’ 2o |-
ke o poumeusvng b | fusle | |
Iu-m Jrteee ]mwmqm ja EF foo ot
tn I e P R - o
b [rutwnesiwomann |, s Jisofroe
'n_qmn berupe 'umam bk F A _' . _‘J-WM
e — " b oo | T
hataa betroe ’n-mmm ) |;,9 u,umla |22 " -
- o RIS SaBaaY e mmlu has lmn -
B o imezmmmmm k Ly n.mllz s hm 1.0 |~
- g - Ju_mE ks foom foed, |
prazon Fﬁmnm bt Iu o oo | 2000
h-s1a8 il (20879910851 bt b
k1152 e samosa fo b pembr uz feompishon
bt och e - pisia (280170 =1 b1 fom bt ks lmnﬁmlm -
[rasa feanpe i'mws’ I b feots lwl"““b
m —— '};m“,m,“ . 4 bs  hagcos lwowuh
ﬂum - —— |"‘mw 83 fsom L;m -
Lm‘ e ]n»mmus.smm R | L“ _
b10s — T s bow b oz foempadh |-
frassn | I-— !pmnummwm " s




Liﬂ RREAZ/TTI0 RSN L5 Ivm’h hm I:m
e . ﬁ 134/M2h REAZY CHEE ) o oo
o e " 7 10w ot
. berrops fprssa sy . | et oo o a0 000
T
E' beotrup lwmmm o % Lwnao om o
a2 ) N -tmw
p . ﬁ INWWSI it he Iu% W
= esotropo ;osmma L . Lma ) hed
" prige__[p0st70 sz | ke oo { 2T
i) jm_m Fm 3 o fmm I’;@ 2
oo e fpipee |, -
- s [reneustece pamamal,, E Lk b
e | P — e pos o paa from |-
m poiops  [R200TsZa (r20r20.0) A E ks Ju Rz h.mlm 3000 |-
el ] Jpotropa I&mmmﬂ pa 120 Fl 24 hkz =
SR N T N T T A
o= N T——— e I*B hﬂ'“ "
e e s 1 ko famafps o [
434 partrops m i - Jx0 -
pest | M b= | s 2 jum]-
. i - [Msnmmm ~ ™ bmhg haw |-
P36 hectraps lmm e o - % g llﬂmp X0 |-
T pe b | s from
P ELt T TCL
- o ETTTET




P

[P ppe |

HEE R
RO I TEIEIE IMEIT
sitgl 1alg 4 4 gid) 13 AR TR
ECLEEEELE ARAOL AHOBODTROL
alalalalalal ol of o a3 o 2 falzal slasts s histe et
M“u |8 mmmwuuh“»mmwmwummmw W
wm-w., m.rm wmmw?wwmm w
i
A TSRO EEEFTREET
144 EERE :;Z_ﬁ il4l3




)y
el

HREBAEER RN

IHEAN AERELEILIESE RN EA T EAENER EA

| ‘ 1 Tatal

_ . HE]

” glals " aleflalalelglsls _.m.hma..n.
. . - a6 ) N =13

1T HHAHANLT mh%ﬁm@fﬁiz
= alaly NIRRT 1 lelals a.m.w.

AR AARHE
: -t
w 1Bt
FREEL G
tlelulslilelaly alalalalalslalelilelalelelalsls




Facbon Sk

pretirope:

——

! _. .. ) M .. .
w lalelelal 18]a]s | 8lslafelals
rir ENEN _laigl
H CIETIR EH |
| F1F . 2
=8 . L1 . alelal S o r
K Blat 0., 120818l /818§ B
1 afal afflal ¥a]a el
53 __ sll]o |

braciacia

=

3 pow w084\, 1 utic Eat wOERD

for 3 ruptume ae Full locy of:

= B ke "
b fechusion to 3004 lowsd I armiysts sethsfaciory v by ance ifkcsed o h
P by Py oy

'- U, cernilasing §

e {TV3A] hureins

d mm,mmmumm_

e et € e rmeling] o 20 3 bl e 20 &7k




